City Council Meetings
4/5/ 2016 7:00:00 PM

SI RE Meeting Contents

| NVOCATI ON

Pastor Kirk Flaa, Abiding Savior Free Lutheran Church

PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE

PROCLAMATI ONS

National Wal king Day - April 6, 2016

Nati onal Service Recognition Day - April 5, 2016

Auti sm Awareness Month - April, 2016

RECOGNI TI ONV AWARDS

VI SI TOR RECOGNI TI ON

CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL COF CONSENT AGENDA

M NUTES

I nformati onal Meeting of Tuesday, March 15, 2016, at 4 p.m

City Council Meeting of Tuesday, March 15, 2016, at 7 p.m

Special City Council Meeting of Thursday, March 31, 2016, at 1:30 p.m
COVMUNI CATI ONS

Approval of contracts/agreenents on the March 31, 2016 neno.

Approval of the notice of change orders on the March 31, 2016 neno.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 9, 2016 #2 Dyed Di esel Fuel
15,000 gallons Stern G| ($1.3036) Harms G| ($1.3186) Howes Q| ($1.3215) CHS,
Inc. (%$1.3500) Coles Petroleum Mdwest GI, Mdway Service (Vollan) and A son
al, all no

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 10, 2016 E-10 Unl eaded

Et hanol / 87 Cctane 8,500 gallons Harns O ($1.5786) Stern Q| ($1.5870) Coles
Petrol eum ($1. 6075) Howes G| ($1.6110) CHS, Inc. ($1.6700) A son G| and
Vollan G|, both no bid

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 11, 2016 30/70 Bl end of
Cl ear Diesel 7,500 gallons CHS, Inc. ($1.77/gallon #1 Clear Diesel / $1.64/
gallon #2 Clear Diesel) Howes O ($1.6875/gallon #1 Cear Diesel / $1.606/
gallon #2 Clear Diesel)

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 16, 2016 #2 Dyed Di esel

Fuel 7,500 gallons Stern Ol (%$1.2589) Cole' s Petrol eum ($1.2811) Harns Q|
($1.2877) Howes Ol ($1.3050) CHS, Inc., Mdwest O I, Mdway Service (Vollan)



and Ason G1l, all n

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 18, 2016 E-10 Unl eaded

Et hanol / 87 Cctane 8,500 gallons Harnms G| ($1.5381) Cole's Petrol eum
($1.5422) Stern O ($1.5579) Howes Ol ($1.6160) CHS, Inc. ($1.6200) O son Gl
and Vollan G|, both no

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 22, 2016 #2 Dyed Di esel
Fuel, 7,500 gallons Harms G| ($1.3257) Stern G| ($1.3336) Cole’s Petrol eum
($1.3370) Howes O | ($1.3390) CHS, Inc. ($1.3700) Mdwest O I, Mdway Service
(Vol l an) and d son

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 22, 2016 30/ 70 Bl end of
Cl ear Diesel 7,500 gallons CHS, Inc. ($1.77/#1 O ear Diesel/$1.64 #2 d ear
Diesel) Howes OQI, Harns Gl, Mdwest GIl, all no bid. Bid awarded to: CHS,
I nc.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 25, 2016 Unl eaded Ethanol
627 gallons Mdway Service ($1.7600) Howes O | ($1.8300) Stern Gl and Cole’'s
Petrol eum both no bid. Bid awarded to: M dway Servi ce.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 25, 2016 Cl ear Diesel #1
269 gallons M dway Service ($1.6650) Howes O | ($1.7280) Stern G| and Cole’'s
Petrol eum both no bid. Bid awarded to M dway Servi ce.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 25, 2016 Cl ear Diesel #2
269 gallons Mdway Service ($1.5750) Howes O | ($1.6480) Stern G| and Cole's
Petrol eum both no bid. Bid awarded to M dway Servi ce.

Report of Requests for Quotes for Fuel dated: March 28, 2016 E-10 Unl eaded

Et hanol / 87 Cctane 8,500 gallons Howes O ($1.5660) Harns G| ($1.5776) Cole’'s
Petrol eum ($1.5816) Stern G| ($1.5954) CHS, Inc. ($1.6195) dson G| and
Vollan Q|, both no bi

A conmuni cati on was received from Eduardo Larios requesting perm ssion to
consune, but not sell, liquor, wine, and/or nmalt beverages at The Coliseum 515
N. Main Avenue, on Saturday, May 28, 2016, from2 p.m - 11:55 p.m, pursuant
to SDCL 35-1-5.5,

COUNCI L’ S | NTERNAL DEPARTMENTAL DI RECTI VES
APPLI CATI ONS

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Hy-Vee
Inc., Al Cccasions by Hy-Vee, to be operated at the Geat Plains Zoo and
Del bri dge Museum 805 South Kiwanis Avenue, for a Chanber M xer on May 10,
2016.

Speci al One-Day Liquor Licenses for Hy-Vee Inc., Al Cccasions by Hy-Vee, to be
operated at the Great Plains Zoo and Del bri dge Museum 805 Sout h Ki wani s
Avenue, for events on June 4 and 8, 2016.

Speci al One-Day Liquor Licenses for Washington Pavilion Managenent Inc., to be
operated at Washington Pavilion of Arts &np Science, 301 South Main Avenue,
for events on May 28, June 25, July 16, July 23, August 20 and Cctober 21,
2016.

Pear|l Kirk, 2412 S. d endal e Avenue, for 2015 taxes in the anpbunt of $1,044.12.
The anmount requested is the difference between the elderly freeze and the non-
el derly freeze.



Ruth A, Garry, 1909 S. WIlians Avenue, for 2015 taxes in the anount of
$1, 483.42. elderly freeze item

LI NCOLN COUNTY. South Pointe LTD Partnership, Parcel: 280.24.13.001, for 2015
property taxes in the anount of $94.34. The City of Sioux Falls purchased on
January 16, 2015.

LI NCOLN COUNTY. Corey Lundy, 6901 S. Shadow Crcle, for 2015 taxes in the
amount of $1, 341.90. Home occupi ed from Cctober 31, 2014, to the present.

LI NCOLN COUNTY DENI ALS. Richard and Mary Lou Krogh, 7413 S. Brookside Pl ace,
for 2015 taxes in the anount of $795.71

LI NCOLN COUNTY DENI AL: Rodney A. and Jani ce Haag, 8001 S. Sunny Oak GCrcle, for
2015 taxes in the anmbunt of $1,967.62.

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS

New 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License for Z Mariks LLC, Z Mari ks Noodl e
Caf, 2300 South M nnesota Avenue, with Conditional Use Permt (4310-2016)
bei ng approved on March 3, 2016.

New 2016 Retail Wne License for Z Mariks LLC, Z Mariks Noodl e Caf, 2300 South
M nnesota Avenue, with Conditional Use Pernit (4310-2016) being approved on
March 3, 2016.

New 2016 Retail Wne License, including video lottery termnals, for
Commonweal th Gam ng &anp Hol di ngs, Deuces Casino 7.5, 4713 East 26th Street,
with Conditional Use Permt (2928-2015) being approved on August 5, 2015.

New 2016 Retail Wne License, including video lottery termnals, for
Commonweal th Gami ng &anp Hol di ngs, Deuces Casino 3.5, 5115 East Arrowhead
Par kway, with Conditional Use Permt (4148-2016) being approved on March 3,
2016.

New 2016-17 Retail Malt Beverage License, including video lottery term nal s,
for Conmonweal th Gani ng &anp Hol di ngs, Deuces Casino 3.5, 5115 East Arrowhead
Par kway, with Conditional Use Permt (4148-2016) being approved on March 3,
2016.

Transfer of 2016 Retail Liquor License, including Sunday sales certificate and
video lottery termnals, fromBehind the Bar Inc., Tinners, 449 West 69th
Street, to Commonweal th Gami ng &np Hol di ngs, Tinners, 449 West 69th Street,
with Conditional Use

Transfer of 2015-16 Retail Malt Beverage License, with video lottery term nal s,
fromJuan Padilla, El Jalapeno Mexican Gill, 2113 South M nnesota Avenue, to
Juan Padilla, Casa Vieja N ghtclub &np Restaurant, 805 North West Avenue (CUP
not required)

New 2016 Retail Wne License, with video lottery ternminals, for Juan Padilla,
Casa Vieja Nightclub &np Restaurant, 805 North West Avenue (CUP not required).

Transfer of 2015-16 Retail Milt Beverage License from Guillerno Pedro, M
Tierra Authentic Mexi can Restaurant &anp Bakery, 337 South Phillips Avenue, to
Quillerno Pedro, M Terra Authentic Mexican Restaurant &anp Bakery, 329 South
Phillips Avenue (CU

Transfer of 2015-16 Retail Milt Beverage License fromLatitude 44 LLC, Latitude



44, 201 North Weber Avenue, to Fernson Taphouse LLC, Fernson on 8th, 201 North
Weber Avenue (CUP not required).

Transfer of 2016 Retail Wne License fromLatitude 44 LLC, Latitude 44, 201
Nort h Weber Avenue, to Fernson Taphouse LLC, Fernson on 8th, 201 North Wber
Avenue (CUP not required).

Speci al One-day Malt Beverage License for JAM Art &anp Supplies to be operated
at Touchrmark at Al Saints, 111 West 17th Street, for the "Art Full" event on
April 30, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for JAM Art &anp Supplies to be operated
at Tower Park, 1000 North Main Avenue, for the "Wiat's Up?" event on June 18,
2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage Licenses for JAM Art &anp Supplies to be operated
at Cherapa Place east parking lot, 300 North Cherapa Place, for the 605 Summrer
O assic on June 24 &anp 25, 2016.

Speci al One-Day Liquor License for Rankota Conpanies Inc., Best Wstern Rankota
Hotel, to be operated at Avera Prairie Center, 1000 East 23rd Street, for a
conference social on May 19, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Rankota
Conpani es Inc., Best Wstern Rankota Hotel, to be operated at Avera Prairie
Center, 1000 East 23rd Street, for a retirenent party on June 27, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Special
A ynpi cs South Dakota to be operated at Yankton Trail Park, 3901 South
M nnesot a Avenue, for the Peach Festival on June 25 &anp 26, 2016.

Speci al One-Day Liquor License for TNT Entertainnment LLC to be operated at 337
North Phillips Avenue (Al bert House parking lot) for an outdoor concert on July
8, 2016.

Speci al One-Day Wne License requests for Downtown Sioux Falls Inc., to be
operated at the following locations: 8th &np Railroad Center Lobby, 401 East
8th Street, 605 Runni ng Conpany, 124 South Phillips Avenue, A League of Your
Omn, 229 South Phil

Speci al One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Downtown
Sioux Falls Inc., to be operated at 8th &np Railroad Parking Lot, 401 East 8th
Street, for Downtown Block Parties on the East Bank on June 3, July 1, August
5, and Sept enbe

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Downtown
Sioux Falls Inc., to be operated at Avera Infornmation Technol ogy Center north
parking lot, 212 East 11th Street, including Geat Qutdoor Store property and
parking lot, 201

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Downtown
Sioux Falls Inc., to be operated on levels 5 &np 6 of the City of Sioux Falls
Par ki ng Ranp, 110 East 11th Street, for Rooftop C nena events on June 23, July
28 and August 2

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Downtown
Sioux Falls Inc., to be operated on Phillips Avenue from9th to 14th Streets
Main Avenue from 10th to 13th Streets, 13th Street from Main to 1lst Avenue,
12th Street from Mai



Speci al One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Downtown
Sioux Falls Inc., to be operated within Phases 1 and 2 of Downtown Riverfront
(from6th Street to South of 8th Street) including Raven Industries riverfront
and parking | ot

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Catering
Anerica Inc., to be operated at 4500 West 58th Street, for an open house event
on May 3, 2016.

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5
APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA
PUBLI C | NPUT

PETI TI ONS

UNFI NI SHED BUSI NESS

New 2016 Package Li quor License for Aldi Inc., Adi Foods #20, 2804 South
Loui se Avenue (CUP not required). Pending final inspections per Fire, Health
&anp Bui l di ng Servi ces.

New 2016 Package Li quor License for Aldi Inc., Adi Foods #21, 5105 East
Arrowhead Parkway (CUP not required). Pending final inspections per Fire,
Heal th &anp Buil di ng Servi ces.

New 2016 Retail Wne License for BYG SF, LLC, Backyard Gill, 323 South
Phillips Avenue (CUP not required). Pending final inspections per Fire, Health
&anp Bui l di ng Servi ces.

Speci al One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for The History
Cub to be operated at Josiah’s Cof feehouse & Caf, 101 South Reid Street, for
a fundraiser on April 7, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for The Country
Cub of Sioux Falls to be operated at Hone Federal Bank, 225 South Main Avenue,
for a Chanber M xer on April 12, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage License for Sisters of the Presentation of the
Bl essed Virgin Mary to be operated at Falls Park, 305 East Falls Park Drive,
for the Cnco de Mayo Fiesta, on May 7, 2016.

Special One-Day Wne License for the Sioux Falls Area Conmunity Foundation to
be operated at Sioux Falls Area Conmunity Foundation, 200 North Cherapa Pl ace,
for a Science Fest social on June 10, 2016.

Speci al One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for Osher
Lifelong Learning Institute to be operated in the CNA Buil di ng Conmuni cati on
Room 101 South Reid and the 8th & Railroad Shopping Center back dock and
pati o, 401 East 8th Stree

Speci al One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for The Center
for Equality to be operated at Terrace Park, 1100 West 4th Street, for a Sioux
Falls Pride event on June 18, 2016.

Special One-Day Malt Beverage and Special One-Day Wne Licenses for
Conmmenorative Air Force Joe Foss Squadron to be operated at Maverick Air
Center, 4201 North Maverick Place, for a Hangar Dance on July 21, 2016.



Special One-Day Wne License for Senior Citizens Services Inc., to be operated
at Active Generations, 2300 West 46th Street, for the Gournmet Quys fundraiser,
on April 17, 2016.

I NTRCDUCTI ON AND ADCPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SOUTH DAKOTA ( THE
"CITY"), AUTHORI ZI NG THE | SSUANCE OF I TS SALES TAX REVENUE BONDS, AUTHCORI ZI NG
THE USE OF THE PROCEEDS THEREOF TO PAY THE COSTS to design, construct, equip,
and furnish AN OFFI CE

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE REVI SED
ORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY ADOPTI NG THE 2015 | NTERNATI ONAL FI RE CODE AND
AVENDMVENTS THERETO

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, ENCOURAG NG PARKI NG
STRI P LANDSCAPI NG AND PROVI DI NG STANDARDS THEREFOR.

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE 2013
SHAPE PLACES ZONI NG ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS. Pl anni ng Conmi ssi on
recomends approval .

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY AT
NORTHEAST CORNER OF S. SHERMAN AVE. AND E. 22ND ST. FROM THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL- SUBURBAN DI STRI CT TO THE RT-1 SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL- TRADI Tl ONAL
DI STRI CT, PE

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY AT
605 N. LA MESA DR. FROM THE AG AGRI CULTURE DI STRICT TO THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL- SUBURBAN DI STRI CT, PETI TI ON NO. 4144-2016, AND AMENDI NG THE

CFFI Cl AL ZONI NG MAP OF

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY AT
120 N. SYCAMORE AVE. FROM THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY RESI DENTI AL- SUBURBAN DI STRI CT TO
THE RA-1 APARTMENT RESI DENTI AL- LOW DENSI TY DI STRI CT, PETI TI ON NO. 4159- 2016,

AND AMENDI NG

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY AT
NORTHWEST CORNER OF N. TERRY AVE. AND W MADI SON ST. FROM THE -1 LI GHT

I NDUSTRI AL DI STRICT TO THE G2 COWVERCI AL- NEI GHBORHOOD AND STREETCAR DI STRI CT,
PETI TION NO. 4179-2

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY AT
SOQUTHWEST CORNER OF E. 26TH ST. AND S. SIX M LE RD. FROM THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL- SUBURBAN AND CN CONSERVATI ON DI STRI CTS TO THE RS SI NGLE- FAM LY
RESI DENTI AL- SUBUR

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, REZONI NG PROPERTY AT
5100 W 12TH ST. FROM THE | -1 LI GHT I NDUSTRI AL DI STRICT TO THE C

3 COWMERCI AL- COMUNI TY DI STRI CT, PETITION NO. 4184-2016, AND AMENDI NG THE

CFFI G AL ZONI NG VAP OF THE CI TY

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE OF
CORDI NANCES OF THE CI TY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 51: UTILITY RATES AND CHARGES
SUBCHAPTER WATER DI STRI BUTI ON PLATTI NG FEE, SECTI ON 51. 065 WATER DI STRI BUTI ON
PLATTI NG FEE.

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE OF
CORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY AMENDI NG CHAPTER 96: STREETS AND S| DEWALKS SUBCHAPTER
ARTERI AL STREET PLATTI NG FEE SECTI ON 96. 220 ARTERI AL STREET PLATTI NG FEE.



2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE NAM NG
OF A FACI LI TY SPACE ON PUBLI C PROPERTY. (Jerstad Gallery).

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, APPROVI NG THE NAM NG
OF A FACI LI TY SPACE ON PUBLI C PROPERTY. (Shultz Gallery).

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE OF
ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY AMENDI NG SECTI ON 124. 012 TO PROVI DE YOUTH AN
CPPORTUNI TY TO RI DE FI XED- ROUTE BUS SERVI CE AT NO CHARGE FROM JUNE 2, 2016, TO
SEPTEMBER 6, 2016.

2nd Readi ng: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CI TY OF S| QUX FALLS, SD, PROVI DI NG
SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRI ATI ONS. ($1, 299, 000 Hi ghways and Streets).

1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, PROVI DI NG
SUPPLEMENTAL APPROPRI ATI ONS FOR AFFORDABLE HOUSI NG PRQIECTS. Affordabl e Housi ng
- CDBG Federal Grant Funds (%1, 138,500.) Affordable Housing - HOVE Federa

Grand Funds ($805,212.) A

1st Reading: AN ORDI NANCE OF THE CI TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG THE CODE OF
ORDI NANCES OF THE CITY BY REVI SI NG CHAPTER 117: PEDDLERS AND VENDORS.

HEARI NGS AND RESOLUTI ONS

A RESCLUTION OF THE CITY OF SI QUX FALLS APPROVI NG THE PRELI M NARY PLAN OF
AKERSON S ADDI TI ON.

A RESCLUTI ON AVENDI NG THE 2016- 2020 CAPI TAL PROGRAM Project No. 11001,
Concrete Pavenent Restoration ($600,000.) Project No. 11074, Surface Treatnent
Program ($200, 000.) Project No. 11018, ADA I|nprovenents ($200,000.) and Project
No. 11003, Major S

A RESCLUTI ON AUTHORI ZI NG AN APPLI CATI ON FCOR FI NANCI AL ASSI STANCE, AUTHORI ZI NG
THE EXECUTI ON AND SUBM TTAL OF THE APPLI CATI ONS, AND DESI GNATI NG AN AUTHORI ZED
REPRESENTATI VE TO CERTI FY AND SI GN PAYMENT REQUESTS.

A RESCLUTI ON | NCLUDI NG CERTAI N CONTI GUOUS TERRI TORY W THI N THE CORPCRATE LIM TS
OF THE G TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD. ANNEXATI ON 3871-2015- ROCKVAM (85TH ST. AND
WESTERN AVE. )

A RESCLUTI ON | NCLUDI NG CERTAI N CONTI GUOUS TERRI TORY W THI N THE CORPCRATE LIM TS
OF THE G TY OF SI QUX FALLS, SD. ANNEXATI ON 4055-2016- JEPSON S ADDI TI ON (65TH
ST. AND CULBERT AVE.)

A RESCLUTI ON ADVI SI NG AND G VI NG CONSENT TO THE APPO NTMENT OF MEMBERS TO
CERTAI N CI TI ZEN BOARDS.

A RESCLUTI ON DECLARI NG THE NECESSI TY TO GRADE, GRAVEL, CONSTRUCT CURB AND
GQUTTER W TH DRI VEWAY APPROACHES, CONSTRUCT SI DEWALK, STORM SEVER, ASPHALT
SURFACI NG WATER, SANI TARY SEVER, AND STREETLI GATS ON S. BRANDE AVE., AND
ASSESSI NG THE COST TO EACH L

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS FOR STREET VACATI ONS

REPORT OF OFFI CERS/ BOARDS/ COVM TTEES/ TRANSFERS OF UNENCUMBERED APPROPRI ATI ON
BALANCES AMONG PROGRAMS W THI N A DEPARTMENT OR ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI T AS PROVI DED
IN THE SI OQUX FALLS C TY CHARTER SECTI ON 5. 07(d)

REPORT OF THE MARCH 31, 2016, NOTI CE OF TRANSFER OF APPROPRI ATI ONS W THI N MAJOR



ORGANI ZATI ONAL UNI TS.

NEW BUSI NESS

| TEMS ADDED AFTER AGENDA DEADLI| NE

ADJ OURNMENT

EXECUTI VE SESSI ON



