| Cty of Sioux Falls Council Meeting |
| Agenda |
| Carnegie Town Hall, 235 West 10th Street |
| MEETI NG OF Wednesday, February 13, 2013 at 7:00 PM |

ROLL CALL
MEMBERS PRESENT/ ABSENT

Counci| Menber Sue Aguil ar

Counci| Menber Kenny Anderson Jr.
Counci | Menber Ji m Ent ennman
Counci| Menber M chell e Erpenbach
Counci| Menber Greg Janison
Counci| Menber Dean Karsky
Counci| Menber Rex Rolfing

Counci| Menber Kernmit L. Staggers
Mayor M ke T. Huet her

I NVOCATI ON

&#9679; City Council Menber Rex Rolfing

PLEDGE OF ALLEG ANCE

CONSENT AGENDA | TEMS

APPROVAL OF CONSENT AGENDA

M NUTES

&#9679; Infornmational Meeting of Tuesday, February 5, 2013, at 4:00 p.m
&#9679; Regular City Council Meeting of Tuesday, February 5, 2013, at 7:00 p.m
COVMUNI CATI ONS

1. Approval of Contracts/Agreenents on February 7, 2013 neno.
Sponsor: Mayor/ Fi nance

2. Notice of change orders on February 7, 2013 neno.



Sponsor: Mayor/ Fi nance

3. Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: January 31, 2013; Unl eaded Ethanol;
8,500 Gallons; Harns O ($3.1270); Howes QO ($3.1345); CHS, Inc.
($3.1680); dson Gl, no bid. Bid awarded to: Harnms O I.

Sponsor: Mayor/ Fl eet

4. Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: January 31, 2013; #2 Clear Diesel;
7,500 Gallons; CHS, Inc. (%$3.444); Harns Q| ($3.423); Howes G| and M dwest
Ql, both no bid. Bid awarded to: Harns GO I.

Sponsor: Mayor/ Si oux Area Metro

5. Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: January 31, 2013; Diesel (#1 and #2
bl end); 600 Gallons; Howes Q1 ($2,098.80); Mdway Service ($2,124.00);
Palisades O, no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes QOl.

Sponsor: Mayor/Sioux Falls Fire Rescue

6. Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: January 31, 2013; Unl eaded; 650
Gl lons; Howes Q| ($2,084.87); Mdway Service ($2,110.55); Palisades Ol
no bid. Bid awarded to: Howes GO l.
Sponsor: Mayor/Sioux Falls Fire Rescue

7. Report of Request for Quotes for Fuel: February 1, 2013; #1 & #2 Dyed
Di esel Fuel; 3,000 Gallons #1 & 4,500 Gallons #2; Howes QO (#1 = $3.3900/ #2
= $3.2235); Harnms O | (#1 = $3.3945/#2 = $3.2325); CHS, Inc. (#1 = $3.6200/
#2 = $3.2400); Mdwest Ol and Ason G, both no bid. Bid awarded to:
Howes Q| .
Sponsor: Mayor/ Fl eet

8. A conmuni cation was received fromthe Siouxland Heritage Miseuns Alliance
stating their intent to sell raffle tickets fromMarch 1, 2013 until June 7,
2013 for a childs oak rocking chair (valued at $250.00). Tickets will be
sold for $2.00 for one. The proceeds will be used for support of Miseum
Qper ati ons.

Sponsor: SDCL 22-25-25

9. A conmuni cation was received fromthe Hi story C ub requesting permssion to
consune, but not sell, wine at the Hstory Club, 758 S. Phillips Avenue on
Tuesdays: March 5, April 2, May 7, June 4, July 2, August 6, Septenber 3,
Cct ober 1, Novenber 5, and Decenber 10, 2013 from6:30 p.m until 8:30 p.m
for nmonthly general neetings.

Sponsor: SDCL 35-1-5.3

APPLI CATI ONS

The foll owi ng abatenents were recommended for approval by the Director of
Equal i zation and the State’s Attorney’'s Ofice for Mnnehaha County; and the
City Attorney for Sioux Falls:

10. David and Constance Langner, Parcel #46027, Tract 1 10 Sengson Addn to City



of Sioux Falls, for 2012 property taxes in the anount of $495.21. The
previ ous board val ue was renoved in error.
Sponsor: SDCL 10-18-1

11. South Dakota Departnent of Transportation, for 2012 property taxes for
Parcel #15126, (EX HY) 3 North Side Gardens Addn to City of Sioux Falls, in
t he anount of $288.57; Parcel #15127, (EX HY) 4 North Side Gardens Addn to
City of Sioux Falls, in the anount of $301.28; Parcel #15138, Lot 16 North
Side Gardens Addn to Gty of Sioux Falls, in the anbunt of $465.25; Parcel
#15139, Lot 17 North Side Gardens Addn to City of Sioux Falls, in the
amount of $465.26; and Parcel #40792, /EX H1/2 North Side Gardens Addn to
Cty of Sioux Falls, in the amount of $579.88. The South Dakota DOT
purchased five properties on May 9, 2012.
Sponsor: SDCL 10-18-1

NOTI CE OF HEARI NGS

Set a date of hearing for Tuesday, March 5, 2013, at 7:00 p.m, for ltem12:

12. A PROPCSED RESOLUTI ON DECLARI NG THE NECESSI TY TO CONSTRUCT SI DEWALK ON N.
KIWANI S AVE., AND ASSESSI NG THE COST TO EACH LOT OR TRACT OF LAND
BENEFI TI NG THEREBY.
Sponsor: Mayor/ Public Wrks

REGULAR AGENDA | TEM5

APPROVAL OF REGULAR AGENDA

PUBLI C | NPUT

I NTRCDUCTI ON AND ADCPTI ON OF ORDI NANCES

Set a date of hearing and 2nd Readi ng for Tuesday, February 19, 2013, at 7:00
p.m, for Item13:

13. 1st Reading: AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF SI OQUX FALLS, SD, AMENDI NG SECTI ON
32.022 OF CHAPTER 32, CITY ORGANI ZATI ONS, TO REFLECT UPDATED TI TLE OF
| NTERNAL AUDI T MANAGER
Sponsor: City Council/Jam son and Aguil ar

NEW BUSI NESS

| TEMS ADDED AFTER AGENDA DEADLI NE

The City Council may include other such business as may cone before this body.
ADJ OURNMENT



MEETI NG ASSI STANCE:  UPON REQUEST, ACCOVMODATI ONS FOR MEETI NGS W LL BE PROVI DED
FOR PERSONS W TH DI SABI LI TIES. PLEASE CONTACT THE CI TY CLERKS OFFI CE,

CARNEG E TOWN HALL, AT (605) 367-8080 (VO CE) OR (605) 367-7039 (TDD) 24 HOURS
I N ADVANCE OF THE MEETI NG

ADDRESS| NG THE COUNCI L: PERSONS ADDRESSI NG THE COUNCI L SHALL USE THE

M CROPHONE AT THE PODI UM  PLEASE STATE YOUR NAME. PRESENTATI ONS ARE LI M TED
TO FI VE M NUTES.

LI VE BROADCASTS OF COUNCI L MEETI NGS ON CI TYLI NK: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGS Al R

LI VE ON TUESDAYS EACH MONTH AT 4:00 P.M COUNCI L COMM TTEE MEETI NGS Al R LI VE
THE FI RST, SECOND, AND THI RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH | MVEDI ATELY FOLLOW NG THE

| NFORVATI ONAL MEETI NG, CI TY COUNCI L MEETINGS Al R LI VE THE FI RST, SECOND, AND
TH RD TUESDAYS OF EACH MONTH AT 7:00 P.M THE JO NT ClI TY COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA
COUNTY COMM SSI ON MEETI NGS Al R LI VE THE FOURTH TUESDAY OF EACH MONTH AT 5: 00
P.M REGULAR MEETINGS OF THE CI TY COUNCI L ARE ALSO ARCHI VED AND AVAI LABLE FOR
VI EW NG ON DEMAND AT WA S| OUXFALLS. ORG LI NKS TO EACH MEETI NGS VI DEO ARE
POSTED ON THE MEETI NG M NUTES AND AGENDAS PAGE.

CLOSED CAPTIONING CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS ARE CLOSE CAPTI ONED ON Cl TYLI NK.

Cl TYLI NK REBROADCAST: | NFORMATI ONAL MEETI NGSAT 1:30 A M AND 9:00 A M ON
THURSDAYS, AND 6:00 P.M ON SATURDAYS. COUNCI L COMM TTEE MEETI NGS AT 12:30 A M
AND 8:00 A.M ON THURSDAYS, AND 5:00 P.M ON SATURDAYS. CI TY COUNCI L MEETI NGS
AT 2:30 AM AND 10: 00 A M ON THURSDAYS, AND 7: 00 P.M ON SATURDAYS. JONT C TY
COUNCI L/ M NNEHAHA COUNTY COWM SSI ON MEETI NGS AT 8:00 A'M ON FI RST FRI DAY AFTER
LI VE MEETING AND 1: 00 P.M ON FI RST SUNDAY AFTER LI VE MEETI NG



